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Jasmine (7Val), ‘It’s not that 
scary, and after the first few days 

I’m finding it really fun. The 
teachers are really helpful too!’ 

Felicity (7Mot), ‘It was hard to 
find my way around the school to 
begin with but now I’m used to it 

and there are plenty of staff 
around to help if you get lost.’ 

Callum (7Asp), ‘It was definitely 
the right choice for me, coming 

to Northgate. Everyone is so 
friendly and the teachers are  

really nice!’ 

Elliot (7Mot), ‘Satchel One is 
where we are set our homework. 
It is easy to use from home, you 
can see what the homework is 

and when it is due. You can            
submit work online and it even 

sends you reminders.’ 

Sophie (7Ten), ‘Starting high 
school is nothing to worry about, 
don’t be afraid to ask questions 

in class or if you are stuck,             
everyone is really helpful. I have 
enjoyed meeting new people in 

my class.’ 

Oscar (7End), ‘It’s been great so 
far and I’ve made friends         
already. The lessons are                 

interesting too. I was worried 
about finding my way round but 
it’s been ok. I’m glad I came to 

Northgate.’ 

Wyn (7Int), ‘At first there are lots 
of new faces, classmates and 

teachers, but now I’ve settled in 
quickly and I’m getting to know 

people. I’ve made new friends in 
my class too.’ 

Emma (7Mot), ‘It was nerve  
wracking to begin with having to 
change classes every lesson but I 
soon got to know my way around 
the school. Now I’m less nervous 

and more excited!’ 

Livvy (7Asp), ‘The first couple of 
weeks went really quickly, the 

hardest thing was finding my way 
around but now I know where 

I’m going. I’m really happy I 
chose Northgate.’ 
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